ASHE COUNTY SHERIFF’'S OFFICE

SHERIFF B. PHIL HOWELL CHIEF DEPUTY DANNY HOUCK

To: Ann Clark
Clerk to the Board of Commissioners
Assistant to the County Manager

From: Brian Greer
Director of Communications
Ashe County Sheriff's Office

|
|
| am requesting to be added to the February 3™ Agenda for the Ashe County Commissioners Meeting. |
This request is for the purpose of discussing the appropriation of funds from the E911 funds for the I
purchase of new furniture in the Ashe County Communications Center.

(Quote and Pre-Approval attached)

Thank you.

. b

Capt. Brian Greer
Director of Communications
Ashe County Sheriff's Office

ASHE COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE WA ASHESHERIFF COR

v & 336.846,5633
140 GOVERNMENT CIRCLE, JEFFERSON, NC 28640 INFO@ASHESO.COM



Ashe Console Furniture

Jernigan, Danette <danette,jernigan@nc.gov>

Mon 1/14/2019 10:52 AM

To:Brian Greer <BGreer@asheso.com>,

Hey Brian,

There is ho cap on console furniture. We only have caps of $1700 on computer waorkstations. If you want to get a quote, you can provide that to us for eligibility on
it because sometimes the vendors include items that are not on the approved use of funds list in the invoices.

Thanks!

Danette Jernigan

911 Financial Review Specialist

NC 911 Board

NC Department of Tnformation Technology
919-754-6534

hitps://itne.gov/nc9 1 lboard

NC DIT s

911 Board

From: Brian Greer <BGreer@asheso.com>

Sent: Monday, January 14, 2019 9:56 AM

To: Jernigan, Danette <danette.jernigan@nc.gov>
Subject: [External] ELIGIBILITY QUESTION



CAUTION: External email. Do not click links or open attachments unless you verified. Send all suspicious email as an attachment to report.spam@nc.gov

DANETTE,

I HAVE A QUESTION CONCERNING WORKSTATION FURNITURE REPLACEMENT. | AM SURE AS WITH EVERYTHING ELSE THERE IS A CAP
ON WORKSTATION FURNITURE. BASED ON BEST PRACTICES REPLACE SCHEDULE OF THE 911 BOARD OUR PSAP SHOULD HAVE GOTTEN
NEW FURNITURE IN 2017. 1 AM LOOKING TO REPLACE IT THIS YEAR BUT | DO NOT KNOW WHAT THE CAP IS PER WORKSTATION.
SPECIFICALLY THE FURNITURE.....NOT INCLUDING COMPUTERS ETC.

IF YOU HAVE A LIST OF CAPS FOR EVERYTHING WE PURCHASE | WOULD LOVE TO HAVE A COPY PLEASE!

THANKS!

Brian Greer

Director of Communications,

Advanced Telecommunicator Certified
TAC, EMD, EFD, EPD, FEMA 15-247/IPAWS
Ashe County Sheriffs Office

Office (336)846-5624

Cell (336)977-5970

Fax (336)846-5643

Email - bgreer@asheso.com



Pursuant to North Carolina General Statuges Chapter 132, Public Records, this electronic mail message and any attachments hereto, as well as any electronic mail message(s) that

might be sent in response to it may be considered public record and as such are subject to request and review by, and disclosure to, third parties.

Emaif correspondence to and from this address may be subject 1o the Narth Carolina Public Records Law and may be disclosed to third parties by an autharized state official.
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January 15, 2020

Ashe County
Wrightline Console Furniture

MGA

Mobile Communications America

Description (Colors/Comments)

Aware Console Medium, with environment system
30" Monitor Pole & Base Plate

20" Monitor Pole & Base Plate

Articulating Column Arm

Z-Bar Led Desk Lamp W/Surf Mnt For Ezone- Black
Fpd Pole Light Bracket

Steel: N/A

bracket for light to attach to pole

Aware 4"Tech Module - Bronze Taupe

Qty Item No
4 CONSOLE SOLUTION
4  AWM6E63DCP8SF
8 KONWLC30B
4  KONWLC20B
28 KONWLK2B
4  AR3910WDMBKTHR
4 AWLIGHTBRKT
4  AWTT4D
4 USBKIT3

3 Pack Usb Ports And Cables
4 CONSOLE SOLUTION

SubTotal
Transportation
Installation
Tax

Total

Ext Price

$52,144.10
$1,395.20
$569.60
$3,987.20
$1,052.80
$89.71

$417.22
$680.18
$60,345.01

$60,345.01

$2,150.00

$8,790.67
Plus Applicable Sales Tax
$71,285.68



Re: Ashe Console Furniture Eligibility

Jernigan, Danette <danette jernigan@nc.gov>

Tue 1/29/2019 3:32 PM

To:Brian Greer <BGreer@asheso.coms;

ceTurbeville, Angie F <angie.turbeville@nc.gov>;

[y 2 attachments

Ashe County Furniture Quote.pdf; ASHE COUNTY WORKSTATION FURNITURE.pdf;

Hey Brian,

We had further discussions amongst staff over the past couple of days regarding the approved seat count for Ashe. | wanted to let you know that based on the
formula, and those further discussions, you are eligible for 4 seats in the primary. The attached quotes are eligible for 911 funds. | have also updated our seat count
document to reflect the 4 approved seats for the primary.

As far as the used equipment, | did talk with Pokey, and it is something that | need to run by Mr. Bradford for further guidance as staff has not had inquiries in the
past regarding used equipment. | will forward your email to him, and ask that he provide some input.

Thank you for your patience while with me dealing with these requests. It’s always a pleasure to work with you,

Danette Jernigan

911 Financial Review Specialist

NC 911 Board

NC Department of Information Technology
919-754-6534

hitps:/fit.ne.gov/ne91 I board

NC DIT [
Sty

91! Board



